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OUR CUSTOM SEED PAPER SHAPES ARE MADE FROM

BIODEGRADABLE PAPER EMBEDDED WITH SEEDS.

SUMMARY

Our custom seed paper shapes are
made from biodegradable paper
embedded with seeds. With full-colour
printing available, you can add your
brand logo, message, or artwork,
making it a memorable and sustainable
promotional item. When planted, the
paper will grow into a beautiful display of
flowers. Perfect for eco-conscious
organisations, weddings, or special
events.

PRODUCT DETAILS

Ideal for unique event invites,
memorable business cards, or
sustainable notes, our custom-shaped
seed paper lets your brand make a
lasting impression. Sustainably Printed
Our seed paper is high-quality, recycled
220gsm plantable paper produced from
waste material originating from the
textile industry. We print each sheet in-
house right here in the UK, minimising
our carbon footprint while ensuring your
message grows into a lasting, beautiful
wildflower display. Grow Anywhere,
Anytime! Our seed paper is
exceptionally versatile, making it perfect
for garden beds, flower pots, and
planters. Whether you&#8217;re in a flat
or a garden, you can enjoy the blooms.
Just plant, water, and watch your flowers
grow. Customise with Your Brand
Choose any shape you want for your
seed paper. Contact us for pricing and
specify whether you want single or
double-sided print, and the footprint size
(e.g., A7/A6). Get your message across
clearly with full-colour printing options,
enhancing your brand&#8217;s
commitment to sustainability and quality.


