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A TRANSPORT-FRIENDLY GIVEAWAY IN A COMPOSTABLE

POUCH, FILLED WITH THREE VAN-SHAPED SEED BOMBS.

SUMMARY

A creative way to promote transport and
logistics brands. The Van Seed Bomb
Pouch contains three van-shaped seed
bombs, packed with native wildflower
seeds. A great fit for couriers, fleet
management, and delivery companies,
it’s a giveaway that makes an impact.
The resealable pouch keeps everything
contained, while the large branding
space ensures your business remains
front and centre.

PRODUCT DETAILS

A promotional giveaway designed for
brands on the move. Each compostable
kraft pouch contains three handmade
van-shaped seed bombs, ideal for
businesses in logistics, transport, and
delivery services. Whether included in
client packs or used as a trade show
giveaway, it’s a unique way to showcase
your brand. The resealable kraft pouch
keeps everything tidy, preventing dust
from escaping, making it suitable for
mailing and gifting. At 85mm x 145mm,
it’s designed to be both practical and
cost-effective for postal campaigns. With
a 75x80mm full-colour branding area,
your message stays in view long after
the first impression. Each pouch also
includes simple planting instructions, so
recipients can easily grow their
wildflowers. Key Features •Three
handmade wildflower seed bombs in a
van shape. •Compostable kraft pouch
with a resealable closure to keep
everything fresh and secure. •Large
75x80mm full-colour branding area for
strong brand visibility. •Compact (85mm
x 145mm) and large letter friendly,
making it ideal for postal campaigns.
•Includes a planting instruction card to
guide recipients.


